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Unparalleled Revival Series
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Unveiling a world of opulence and 
adaptability, our Revival Series offers an 
array of sizes to complement your unique 
lifestyle. With six meticulously curated 
options, these safes redefine exclusivity 
and cater to your every desire. Allow your 
valuable treasures to find their rightful 
place within these safes, tailored to your 
individual needs. Experience unrivaled 
convenience and serenity like never before.

LIMITLESS 
POSSIBILITIES

http://www.valorforce.com


Dual encryption, balancing security and user 
experience through the integration of science 
and culture.

DUAL-LAYER 
SECURITY AND 
SEAMLESS USER 
EXPERIENCE

Fingerprint and Password Encryption



Our door panel features SUS stainless steel 
anti-drilling armor, ensuring unyielding 
defense against intrusion attempts. 
Experience unmatched protection for your 
valuables, as our safes stands as an 
impenetrable fortress. Rest easy knowing 
that your belongings are safeguarded with 
utmost security.

SUS STAINLESS 
STEEL ARMOR  
DEFIES DRILLING 
ATTEMPTS

Unbreakable Protection



Experience effortless functionality with our 
zinc alloy handle design. Harmoniously 
blending with the entire cabinet, it adds a 
touch of elegance to your safes. Embrace 
the perfect fusion of style and practicality 
with our thoughtfully crafted handle design.

RESETTABLE ZINC 
ALLOY HANDLE

Seamless Integration



Discover elegant storage for your exquisite 
jewellery. Our high-end drawer provides a 
stylish and organised solution for necklaces, 
rings, and more. Embrace the perfect blend 
of elegance and practicality, where every 
detail is meticulously considered.

ELEGANT AND 
ORGANISED

Exquisite Jewellery Storage*

* 1 Drawer - R45, R60, R70 & R80


* 2 Drawers - R100 & R120



Discover the hidden compartment, a space 
designed for ultimate privacy. Enjoy the 
discreet storage it offers, adding an extra 
layer of confidentiality. Experience privacy 
perfected with our innovative design.

PRIVACY 
PERFECTED

Subtle Hidden Compartment*

* R120, R100, R80, R70 & R60
















